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TAUNTON DEANE BOROUGH COUNCIL 
 

PLANNING COMMITTEE - 31 JULY 2002 
           
1.  The following appeals have been lodged: 
 
    Date Application 
Appellant       Considered   Proposal 
 
Mr and Mrs Earp               -   Appeal against Listed Building 

Enforcement - Unauthorised 
banner 

        and signs at 2 Church Square.   
 
Mr P Whiston         12.12.2001   Conversion of barn to form holiday 
(13/2001/005 and      let and formation of residential  
 13/2002/001)       curtilage at Higher Way, Cushuish. 
 
Mr and Mrs Cleft        12.12.2001   Continued use of land to site 

mobile 
(46/2001/012)       Home, Mazzelsha Farm, West 

Buckland Hill, Wellington.  Also 
appeal against enforcement notice.  

 
Mr P Diment              DD   Erection of single storey dining 

room 
(38/2002/031)       and conservatory to the rear of 3 

Cedar Close, Poplar Road, 
Taunton. 

 
Mr R G Danes              DD   Erection of agricultural building 

and 
(29/2002/002)       formation of access, land adjoining 

Otterford Caravan Site, Culmhead. 
 
2.  The following appeal decisions have been received:-   
 

(a) Erection of a dwelling adjoining Cobblestones, Bradford on Tone 
 (07/2001/011) 

 
The Inspector considered the main issues were (1) the effect of the development 
on the surrounding area, having regard to local and national planning policies for 
rural areas, and (2) whether the development complied with up to date 
development plan policies and government guidance relating to sustainability, and 
accessibility by means of travel other than the private car.   

 
The Inspector felt that the construction of a new dwelling on the site, which lay to 
the north of the existing built environment, and not within a group of residential 
properties, would serve to make the area appear a little less rural.  In his opinion, 
the appeal proposal would neither maintain nor enhance the environmental quality 
and landscape character of the area.   
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The Inspector noted that the facilities available within the village were very 
limited and although there were a number of employment opportunities within a 
radius of about a mile, they tended to be mainly located along the busy A38.  In 
view of the lack of specific facilities for cyclists and pedestrians, together with the 
limited public transport service available, he considered that these places of 
employment were not readily accessible other than by private car.   

 
The Inspector concluded that the proposed development would not comply with 
up to date development plan policies and government guidance relating to 
sustainability and accessibility by means of travel other than the private car.   

 
The appeal was, therefore, dismissed.  An application by the Council for an award 
of costs against the appellant was also dismissed.   

 
(b) Erection of a bungalow on land between Sunnydale and 1-4 Tithill Lane, 

Bishops Lydeard (06/2001/078) 
 

The Inspector considered the main issue was whether the proposal would result in 
unjustified and harmful development in the countryside, contrary to the 
Development Plan and Government guidance.   

 
The Inspector was in no doubt that to allow the proposal would have several 
unacceptable consequences.  The erection of a dwelling on the site would 
consolidate the small scatter of dwellings in the location, further eroding the open 
appearance and character of the area.  Also the proposal would not foster the sort 
of sustainable development pattern that local and national policies sought to 
achieve.  There was no public transport to serve the site and Tithill Lane was 
mostly a single-track access road ill designed to cater for additional traffic.  In 
addition, the Inspector felt that encouraging more people to live in isolated 
locations in the countryside only served to add to the difficulty of providing them 
with social and community services.   

 
The appeal was, therefore, dismissed.   
 

(c) Erection of a double garage to replace shed at Warrens Barn, Churchinford 
(29/001/010) 

 
The Inspector considered the main issue was whether the proposal would harm 
the landscape character of the Blackdown Hills Area of Outstanding Natural 
Beauty (AONB).   

 
He considered that the proposed garage, which would mirror the existing barn 
conversion, would have only limited visibility from the surrounding countryside 
and would not reduce the openness of the AONB or break any skyline views.   
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The Inspector was therefore satisfied the proposal would not harm the landscape 
character of the AONB but rather enhance it by quality development of a 
reasonable scale and intended use.   

 
The appeal was, therefore, allowed.   

 
 (d) Change of use, conversion and extension and alteration to a building to form 

a two bedroom dwelling at 90 Trull Road, Taunton (52/2001/029) 
 
  The Inspector considered the main issue was whether the proposal would preserve 

or enhance the character and appearance of the Trull Road Conservation Area. 
 
  The Inspector noted that the proposal would involve the change of use of an 

existing building and the development of only a limited part of the curtilage to 
No. 90.  He noted although the dwelling would be a separate unit, its scale and 
design would ensure that it remained subservient in form to the dominant 
presence of the buildings to the east.   

 
  He felt that whilst it was proposed to enlarge the building the extension would 

largely be glazed and would take place along the ‘footprint’ of a greenhouse that 
was previously attached to the rear of the building.  He felt that the proposal 
would sit comfortably within its context without harming the character of the 
area.   

 
The Inspector concluded that the development would preserve the character and 
enhance the appearance of the Trull Road Conservation Area.   

 
The appeal was, therefore, allowed.   

 
(e) Erection of extension to the rear of Twoses Barn, Payton, Wellington 

(43/2001/119) 
 

The Inspector considered the main issue was whether or not the proposed 
development would have an adverse impact upon the architectural integrity and 
traditional character of the existing dwelling, to the detriment of the visual 
amenities of the locality.   

 
It was acknowledged that the simple shape of the building had already been 
compromised and that its character and setting had been dramatically altered by 
the two extensions already allowed to the dwelling and the two rather large and 
conspicuous buildings that had been erected close by.   

 
The Inspector felt that the proposed extension was of sympathetic design and 
would be constructed of matching materials and would not be seen from the 
public highway.  It would be sited to the rear of the main dwelling and would be 
set into the natural slope of the land.   

 
The Inspector was satisfied that the appearance of the original barn would be 
retained and the proposed development would not, in his opinion, adversely 
impact upon the architectural integrity and traditional character of the existing 
building or be detrimental to the visual amenities of the locality.   

 
The appeal was, therefore, allowed.   
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 (f) Erection of a private dwelling and access thereto on land to the south of 

Orchard Barton, Sherford (38/2000/443) 
 

Due to the complexity of the Inspector’s decision letter, a full copy is attached for 
the information of Members.   

 
The appeal was dismissed.   

 
 (g) Application for Certificate of Lawfulness for the display of motor vehicles on 

land adjacent to A361 at Durston Elms Garage (16/2000/004LE) 
 

Due to the complexity of the Inspector’s decision letter, a full copy is attached for 
the information of Members.   

 
The appeal was allowed.   
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